



SHERIFFS' ASSOCIATION OF TEXAS

Name of Dealership	Type of Vehicle	Zone	Base Unit Price
<u>RAM 3500 TRADESMAN REGULAR CHASSIS CAB 4X2 10K GVWR 143.5" WB; CA OF 60" (DF3L63) (Specification #73)</u>			
Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	★Longhorn	\$26,861.00
	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	Longhorn	-- NB --
Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	★Lupine	\$26,811.00
	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	Lupine	-- NB --
Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	★Bluebonnet	\$27,511.00
	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	Bluebonnet	-- NB --
Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	★Mockingbird	\$27,411.00
	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	Mockingbird	-- NB --
Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	★Yellow Rose	\$26,511.00
	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	Yellow Rose	-- NB --
Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	★Armadillo	\$26,836.00
	2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)	Armadillo	-- NB --



SHERIFFS' ASSOCIATION OF TEXAS

RAM 3500 TRADESMAN REGULAR CHASSIS CAB 4X2 10K GVWR 143.5" WB; CA OF 60" (DF3L63) SPECIFICATION #73

2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)

Additional body and option codes available.

ALL ITEMS FACTORY INSTALLED UNLESS OTHERWISE INDICATED

INSTRUCTIONS: Listed above, you will find the model numbers of the vehicles that will be included in this year's contract.

1. ENGINE:

- a. 6.4L V8 Heavy Duty HEMI Engine (ESB)

2. PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

- a. Manufacturer's Standard Power Steering
- b. Manufacturer's Standard Gauges

3. COMFORT ITEMS:

- a. Manufacturer's Standard Air Conditioning
- b. Manufacturer's Standard Tinted Glass All Around
- c. Manufacturer's Standard AM/FM Stereo
- d. Power Windows, Power Door Locks, Cruise Control, and Tilt Steering Wheel
- e. Manufacturer's Standard Floor Covering
- f. Manufacturer's Standard Production Seats. Purchaser will select color at the time of the purchase
- g. Keys: (2) Per Vehicle, Single Key Locking System (each vehicle is keyed differently)

4. SAFETY ITEMS:

- a. Dual Outside Mirrors and Inside Rearview Mirror
- b. Interior Dome Lights with Left and Right Door Activated Switches
- c. Manufacturer's Standard Air Bags

5. BRAKES:

- a. Four Wheel Anti-Lock Brake ABS

6. TIRES AND WHEELS

- a. Manufacturer's Standard Tires and Wheels
- b. Manufacturer's Spare Tire and Rim, if available

7. CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB

- a. Manufacturer's Standard Fuel Tank



SHERIFFS' ASSOCIATION OF TEXAS

RAM 3500 TRADESMAN REGULAR CHASSIS CAB 4X2 10K GVWR 143.5" WB; CA OF 60" (DF3L63) SPECIFICATION #73

2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)

The Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and VSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	★Longhorn	★Lupine	★Bluebonnet	★Mockingbird	★Yellow Rose	★Armadillo
BASE PRICE:	\$26,861.00	\$26,811.00	\$27,511.00	\$27,411.00	\$26,511.00	\$26,836.00
DELIVERY TIME:	90 - 120 days	90 - 120 days	90 - 120 days	90 - 120 days	90 - 120 days	90 - 120 days

Please note: Delivery time may extend past the delivery time listed above as a result of delays from the manufacturer.

While the Sheriffs' Association of Texas has attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

VEHICLE:	3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)					
DEALER:	Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd	Houston Mac Haik Dodge Jeep Ltd
ZONE:	★Longhorn	★Lupine	★Bluebonnet	★Mockingbird	★Yellow Rose	★Armadillo
BASE PRICE:	\$26,861.00	\$26,811.00	\$27,511.00	\$27,411.00	\$26,511.00	\$26,836.00

All awarded dealers are required by the SAT Terms and Conditions to offer a minimum 6% discount off MSRP on all available options. For a comprehensive list of all available options on this vehicle please access the SAT procurement website and go to the Vehicle Procurement page. Please contact awarded dealer for your quote. Note: Available options subject to change mid contract by manufacturer.

Order Code	Delete Options	All Zones
	Delivery Fee – Mockingbird District <i>Credit for Vehicles Not delivered by Mac Haik</i> ¹	\$1,200.00 ¹
	Delivery Fee – Bluebonnet District <i>Credit for Vehicles Not delivered by Mac Haik</i> ¹	\$1,300.00 ¹
	Delivery Fee – Longhorn District <i>Credit for Vehicles Not delivered by Mac Haik</i> ¹	\$650.00 ¹
	Delivery Fee – Lupine District <i>Credit for Vehicles Not delivered by Mac Haik</i> ¹	\$600.00 ¹
	Delivery Fee – Yellow Rose District <i>Credit for Vehicles Not delivered by Mac Haik</i> ¹	\$300.00 ¹
	Delivery Fee – Armadillo District <i>Credit for Vehicles Not delivered by Mac Haik</i> ¹	\$625.00 ¹

Order Code	Add Options	All Zones
DF8L63 ¹	Ram 3500 Tradesman Regular Chassis Cab 4X4 10K GVWR 143.5" WB; CA of 60"	\$2,249.00 ¹
DF3L93 ¹	Ram 3500 Tradesman Crew Chassis Cab 4X2 10K GVWR 172.4" WB - CA of 60"	\$2,076.00 ¹
DF8L93 ¹	Ram 3500 Tradesman Crew Chassis Cab 4X4 10K GVWR 172.4" WB - CA of 60"	\$5,104.00 ¹
TBB ¹	Optional Equipment - Specify <i>Full Size Spare Tire</i> ¹	Incl. ¹
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	



SHERIFFS' ASSOCIATION OF TEXAS

RAM 3500 TRADESMAN REGULAR CHASSIS CAB 4X2 10K GVWR 143.5" WB; CA OF 60" (DF3L63) SPECIFICATION #73

2021 Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63)

(Alternate Dealer Option)

The Ram 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63) purchased through this contract comes with all the standard equipment as specified by the manufacturer for this model and VSA's base vehicle specification(s) requirements which are included and made a part of this contract's vehicle base price as awarded by specification by zone.

ZONE:	Longhorn	Lupine	Bluebonnet	Mockingbird	Yellow Rose	Armadillo
BASE PRICE:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --
DELIVERY TIME:	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --	-- No bid --

Please note: Delivery time may extend past the delivery time listed above as a result of delays from the manufacturer.

While the Sheriffs' Association of Texas has attempted to identify and include those equipment items most often requested by participating agencies for full size vehicles, we realize equipment needs and preferences are going to vary from agency to agency. In an effort to incorporate flexibility into our program, we have created specific add/delete options which allow the purchaser to tailor the vehicle to their particular wants or needs.

The following equipment delete and add options and their related cost are provided here to assist you in approximating the total cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order through this program. Simply deduct the cost of any of the following equipment items you wish deleted from the base unit cost and/or add the cost of any equipment items you wish added to the base unit cost to determine the approximate cost of the type vehicle(s) you wish to order.

NOTE: An official listing of all add/delete options and their prices should be obtained from the appropriate dealer in your zone when preparing your order. Additional add/delete options other than those listed here may be available through the dealers, however, those listed here must be honored by the dealers in your zone at the stated prices.

VEHICLE: 3500 Regular Chassis Cab 4X2 143.5 WB (DF3L63) (ALTERNATE DEALERS)

DEALER:

ZONE: Longhorn Lupine Bluebonnet Mockingbird Yellow Rose Armadillo

BASE PRICE: -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

All awarded dealers are required by the SAT Terms and Conditions to offer a minimum 6% discount off MSRP on all available options. For a comprehensive list of all available options on this vehicle please access the SAT procurement website and go to the Vehicle Procurement page. Please contact awarded dealer for your quote. Note: Available options subject to change mid contract by manufacturer.

Order Code	Delete Options	All Zones
	Delivery Fee – Mockingbird District	
	Delivery Fee – Bluebonnet District	
	Delivery Fee – Longhorn District	
	Delivery Fee – Lupine District	
	Delivery Fee – Yellow Rose District	
	Delivery Fee – Armadillo District	

Order Code	Add Options	All Zones
DF8L63 ¹	Ram 3500 Tradesman Regular Chassis Cab 4X4 10K GVWR 143.5" WB; CA of 60"	1
DF3L93 ¹	Ram 3500 Tradesman Crew Chassis Cab 4X2 10K GVWR 172.4" WB - CA of 60"	1
DF8L93 ¹	Ram 3500 Tradesman Crew Chassis Cab 4X4 10K GVWR 172.4" WB - CA of 60"	1
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	
	Optional Equipment - Specify	